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Introduction 

Climate change, driven primarily by human activities, is 

leading to a cascade of environmental changes that pose 
significant challenges to human health worldwide (IPCC, 

2021). These changes, including rising temperatures, 

altered precipitation patterns, increased UV radiation, and 

heightened air pollution, are impacting human health in 
various ways, particularly in vulnerable communities. 

Nigeria, with its diverse climate, high population density, 

and existing health challenges, is especially susceptible to 
the detrimental effects of climate change, including its 
impact on skin health. 

Skin, the body's largest organ, acts as a primary barrier 
against environmental insults. Exposure to extreme heat, 

increased UV radiation, and pollutants can disrupt the skin's 

protective functions, leading to inflammation and a 

heightened risk of developing various skin conditions 
(Diffey, 2002). In Nigeria, a significant portion of the 

population engages in outdoor activities for livelihood, 

further increasing their vulnerability to climate change-
related skin issues. Furthermore, the lack of access to clean  

 

 

 

 

water, sanitation, and healthcare facilities in certain 

communities amplifies the risk of skin infections and 
aggravates pre-existing skin conditions (WHO, 2010). 

Climate Change Drivers and Skin Inflammation 

Several climate change-related factors are hypothesized to 

contribute to increased skin inflammation in Nigerian 
communities. 

Increased Temperatures and Humidity: Rising temperatures 

and increased humidity create an environment conducive to 

microbial growth, potentially leading to an increase in 

infections and exacerbation of existing skin conditions like 
eczema and fungal infections (Onyewu et al., 2018). 

Enhanced UV Radiation: Increased UV radiation due to 

ozone depletion and climate change can damage skin cells, 
leading to sunburn, premature aging, and increased risk of 

skin cancer (Diffey, 2002). This is particularly concerning 

in Nigeria, where high UV exposure levels are already 
prevalent. 

Air Pollution: The increase in air pollution, stemming from 
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vehicular emissions, industrial activities, and biomass 
burning, can trigger inflammatory responses in the skin, 

leading to conditions like contact dermatitis and 
exacerbation of existing skin disorders (Kim et al., 2018). 

Changes in Precipitation Patterns: Irregular rainfall 

patterns, including droughts and floods, can impact water 

quality, leading to increased exposure to contaminated 

water sources. This can result in skin infections and 
exacerbate existing skin conditions such as eczema and 
scabies (WHO, 2010). 

Socio-economic Vulnerabilities 

The impact of climate change on skin health is further 
compounded by socio-economic factors prevalent in many 
Nigerian communities. 

Poverty and Limited Access to Healthcare: Poverty restricts 

access to essential healthcare services, including 

dermatological care. This can lead to delayed or inadequate 

treatment of skin conditions, resulting in severe 
complications and increased suffering. 

Lack of Awareness and Education: Limited understanding 

of climate change and its impact on skin health hinders 

preventative measures and early detection of skin problems. 
Educational campaigns and public awareness programs are 

crucial to empower individuals to mitigate the risks 
associated with climate change-induced skin inflammation. 

Limited Access to Clean Water and Sanitation: Inadequate 

access to clean water and sanitation facilities increases the 

risk of skin infections and parasitic infestations, particularly 
among vulnerable populations. 

Conclusion and Future Directions 

The evidence suggests a potential link between climate 

change and the increased prevalence of skin inflammation 

in Nigerian communities. The effects of rising 
temperatures, enhanced UV radiation, air pollution, and 

altered precipitation patterns are compounded by socio-

economic vulnerabilities, leading to a heightened risk of 
skin diseases and exacerbating existing conditions. 

Further research is crucial to establish a more definitive link 

between climate change and skin inflammation in the 

Nigerian context. This research should focus on 
epidemiological studies exploring the incidence and 

prevalence of skin diseases in different regions and 

communities across Nigeria, linked to specific climate 
change-related indicators. Moreover, interventions targeted 

at mitigating the impact of climate change on skin health 

must be prioritized. These interventions should include 

public health campaigns focusing on skin protection, 
improved access to clean water and sanitation services, and 

readily available dermatological care, particularly in 
vulnerable communities. 

Furthermore, collaborations between government agencies, 
NGOs, and healthcare professionals are essential to develop 

and implement effective strategies to address the 

multifaceted challenges posed by climate change on skin 

health in Nigeria. By understanding the complex interplay 
between climate change, environmental factors, and socio-

economic conditions, we can work towards minimizing the 

burden of skin inflammation and safeguarding the health 
and well-being of Nigerian communities in the face of a 
changing climate. 
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